
Price: £70,000 Subject to Contract

Viewing: Strictly by arrangement with The Agents  (01704) 500 008  

Two Bedrooms

Patio
No Chain

Retirement Flat For The Over 55’s

70% Shared Equity
Ground Floor Position

Vernon Court
Scarisbrick New Road, Southport, PR8 6NZ



Occupying a ground floor position, with no onward 
chain, an early inspection is recommended of this two 
bedroom, purpose built retirement flat for the over 55's.

The property is offered for sale under a shared equity 
scheme for the elderly with the asking price 
representing a 70% share.

The gas centrally heated and double glazed 
accommodation would benefit from some general 
updating and briefly comprises: Hall, Lounge/Dining 
Room with Balcony/Patio off, Kitchen, Utility, two 
Bedrooms and Bathroom.

Outside, the development stands in well maintained 
communal gardens with residents parking.

Positioned on the corner of Scarisbrick New Road and 
Cumberland Road, the property is convenient for bus 
routes into Southport town centre, with the amenities of 
Kew also readily available.



GROUND FLOOR:

Hall

Lounge/Dining Room - 5.18m x 3.66m (17'0" x 12'0")

Balcony/Patio

Kitchen - 3.81m x 2.31m (12'6" x 7'7")

Utility - 2.31m x 1.24m (7'7" x 4'1")

Bedroom 1 - 3.81m x 3.78m (12'6" x 12'5")

Bedroom 2 - 3.78m x 2.13m (12'5" x 7'0")

Bathroom - 2.44m x 1.8m (8'0" x 5'11")

Outside: The development stands in well maintained 

communal gardens with residents parking.

Note: The property is offered for sale on behalf of Plum 
Life Property Management under the leasehold 
scheme for the elderly, (55 years and over to qualify). 
The purchase price represents seventy per cent of the 
open market value of the property as determined by a 
Chartered Surveyor.

Council Tax: Enquiries made of the Council Tax 
Valuation List indicate the property has been placed in 
Band (C).

Tenure: Leasehold for a residue term of 60 years from 

5th July 2000

Service Charge: We are informed the service charge 
amounts to £2325.6 as a contribution towards the cost 
of general maintenance of the development, buildings 
insurance, window cleaning, cleaning and lighting of 
the communal areas, sinking fund, lift maintenance, 
management fees, and upkeep of grounds.

Mobile Phone Signal: Check signal strengths by clicking 
this link: https://www.signalchecker.co.uk/

Broadband: Check the availability by clicking this link: 
https://labs.thinkbroadband.com/local/index.php

NB: We are required under the Money Laundering 
Regulations to check Purchaser's Identification 
Documents at the time of agreement to purchase.
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